
DAY OF COORDINATION

PRICING GUIDE

PARTIAL PLANNING

FULL SERVICE PLANNING

This package is perfect for clients who want a
wedding professional overseeing every aspect
of their wedding day or weekend.

$6,000+

NoorflowerEvents

This package is perfect for those who have
planned half of their wedding, but need help
with the details.

$4,000+

This package is a perfect for those who want to
plan their own wedding, but need a wedding
professional to coordinate the details on the day.

$2,000+



OFFICIANT PACKAGE

OFFICIANT PRICING GUIDE

NoorflowerEvents

2 - 60 Minute Planning Consultations via Zoom
(or in person)
Personalized and Fully Customized Secular
Wedding Ceremony
Love Story Relationship Questionnaire
Editable and Shareable Access to Your
Ceremony Script
Unlimited Script Revisions (up to one week
before wedding)
Travel Fee to the Ceremony Venue
Early Arrival (one hour before ceremony start
time)
Collaboration with Your Wedding Planner
and/or DJ to Ensure Ceremony Flows Properly
Ceremony Content Review with Your
Photographer and Videographer 
Back-up Officiant in an Unlikely Case of Illness
Signing and Mailing Your Marriage License
Details about Obtaining Certified Copies of
your Marriage Record and Changing Your
Name

$850.00

https://www.officianteric.com/questionnaire/

